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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA

CASE NO. 1:16-cv-21301-DPG

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff,

v.

ARIEL QUIROS,
WILLIAM STENGER,
JAY PEAK, INC.,
Q RESORTS, INC.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES PHASE II L.P.,
JAY PEAK MANAGEMENT, INC.,
JAY PEAK PENTHOUSE SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES, INC.,
JAY PEAK GOLF AND MOUNTAIN SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES GOLF, INC.,
JAY PEAK LODGE AND TOWNHOUSES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES LODGE, INC.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES STATESIDE L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES STATESIDE, INC.,
JAY PEAK BIOMEDICAL RESEARCH PARK L.P.,
AnC BIO VERMONT GP SERVICES, LLC,

Defendants, and

JAY CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT, INC.,
GSI OF DADE COUNTY, INC.,
NORTH EAST CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.,
Q BURKE MOUNTAIN RESORT, LLC,

Relief Defendants.
______________________________________/

DEFENDANT ARIEL QUIROS’ MOTION FOR ORDER
PERMITTING PAYMENT OF ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS

AND SUPPORTING MEMORANDUM OF LAW
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Defendant Ariel Quiros, by and through undersigned counsel, hereby moves this Court

for an order permitting him to pay his fees and costs incurred in connection with this action and

in the action State of Vermont v. Quiros, Docket no. 217-4-16Wncv (Superior Court, April 14,

2016) (the “Vermont Action”). The reasons for this Motion are set forth in the following

Memorandum of Law and Declaration of David Gordon, filed herewith as Exhibit A. In sum,

these fees and costs were incurred in connection with the defense of Mr. Quiros in this action and

the Vermont Action, and were necessary and reasonable in connection with that defense.

As detailed below, Plaintiff further moves the Court for an order releasing: $50,000 to

pay Quiros’ accounting expert’s retainer; $25,000 to retain substitute Florida counsel, Gray

Robinson; additional reasonable sums necessary to retain local counsel in the Vermont Action.

I. INTRODUCTION

The Securities and Exchange Commission (“SEC”) and the State of Vermont have filed

two complex lawsuits leveling serious—and meritless—charges against Defendant Ariel Quiros.

Like all defendants, Mr. Quiros has a right to defend himself. In that connection, he has already

incurred substantial fees and costs. He therefore brings this Motion for an order permitting him

to pay his fees incurred in connection with this action and in the action State of Vermont v.

Quiros, Docket no. 217-4-16Wncv (Superior Court, April 14, 2016) (the “Vermont Action”).

Such fees total $204,852. In addition, Defendant Quiros seeks the release of an additional

$50,000 to pay his accounting expert’s retainer in this matter; $25,000 to retain substitute Florida

counsel, Gray Robinson; and additional reasonable amounts sufficient to retain counsel in the

Vermont Action. As set forth in the Declaration of David Gordon, Esq. (“Gordon Decl.”), these

fees and costs are necessary and reasonable in light of the seriousness and the complexity of this

case.
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II. STATEMENT OF FACTS

Since the SEC’s ex parte filing on April 13, 2016 of an eighty-one-page Complaint, a

sixty-page Motion for a Temporary Restraining Order and Preliminary Injunction, and a Motion

to Appoint a Receiver (the “Florida Action”), three partners and a senior associate from the law

firm of Mitchell Silberberg & Knupp LLP (“MSK”) have spent significant time working on

behalf of Quiros to defend against the SEC’s claims. Gordon Decl. ¶ 2. Two additional

associates have provided assistance with significant legal research needed to oppose the SEC’s

submissions, and Quiros has also engaged the law firm of Berger Singerman LLP as local

counsel, as well as for substantive assistance in the analysis of the SEC’s allegations against him.

Id. ¶ 2. While the SEC had months, and perhaps years, to prepare its papers, Quiros’ attorneys

have had to begin almost from scratch and have undertaken significant amounts of legal

research, fact gathering, analysis, witness interviews, document review and expert preparation on

Quiros’ behalf in the three weeks since the SEC’s sudden commencement of this action. Id. ¶ 3.

This work further consists of the close review of the documents submitted by the SEC in support

of its motions, which include thousands of pages of prior SEC testimony, dozens of witness and

party declarations, and hundreds of individual documents. Id. ¶ 3.

Collectively, Quiros’ attorneys in the Florida Action have filed the following papers,

requiring hundreds of hours of attorney time: an Emergency Motion to Lift or Modify the Asset

Freeze Order; a Declaration from Quiros in support of the same; a Supplemental Declaration

from Quiros as ordered by the Court in support of Quiros’ Application for the Release of Funds

for Living Expenses; the Opposition to the SEC’s Motion for the Appointment of a Receiver and

a Preliminary Injunction; and Declarations in Support of Quiros’ Opposition. Id. ¶ 4. The

attorney time necessary to draft and file these documents in such a short period of time has been
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substantial and all consuming, given the expedited nature of the proceeding and sheer breadth of

the allegations, spanning eight years and eight limited partnerships. Id. ¶ 4.

In addition, the State of Vermont has also filed the Vermont Action against Quiros and

the additional defendants in this action. Id. ¶ 5. The fifty-page complaint in the Vermont Action

contains fifteen counts and alleges violations of Vermont’s state securities laws and Consumer

Protection Act. Id. ¶ 5. MSK attorneys have been actively coordinating Quiros’ defense of the

Vermont Action and have spent substantial time seeking to obtain local counsel to assist in

Quiros’ defense, as Vermont requires, a task made particularly time consuming and difficult

given the scope of the allegations in the Vermont Action and number of firms that have had

disqualifying conflicts to a representation of Quiros. Id. ¶ 5. MSK attorneys have closely

analyzed the allegations of the Vermont Action; researched Vermont law in connection with the

preparation of a response to the complaint; and reviewed the file in the Florida Action in order to

analyze and defend against the claims asserted, including spending hours reviewing the multiple

volumes of SEC transcripts of Quiros and co-defendant William Stenger. Id. ¶ 5. A response to

the Complaint in the Vermont Action is currently due on June 10, 2016. Id. ¶ 5. In connection

with this work, Quiros has incurred attorney’s fees through April 30, 2016 in the amount of

$204,852. Id. ¶ 6.

Plaintiff also has retained an expert accountant in connection with the Florida Action.

That expert will require a $50,000 retainer. Moreover, his initial Florida counsel has been

withdrawn from the case, and the law firm of Gray Robinson will substitute in and seeks an

initial $25,000 retainer. Finally, Quiros should be permitted additional reasonable funds to retain

local counsel in the Vermont Action.
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DEFENDANTS’ ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS ARE OBJECTIVELY
REASONABLE.

The fees incurred in connection with MSK’s representation are reflected in Exhibit 2 to

the Gordon Declaration through invoices that have been redacted for attorney client privilege and

work product. To summarize, MSK attorneys have:

• Reviewed and analyzed two complaints raising complex factual

and legal issues;

• Conferred with Quiros and others as part of fact investigation;

• Reviewed the SEC’s papers filed in support of the motion for a

preliminary injunction;

• Drafted and revised pleadings in connection with the motion to lift

the asset freeze and the SEC’s motion for a preliminary injunction in the Florida

Action;

• Researched numerous issues relating to federal and Vermont

securities laws, the standards for freezing assets, and the issues raised in the

preliminary injunction;

• Communicated with the receiver;

• Drafted declarations in connection with the motions filed in the

Florida Action;

• Organized numerous exhibits in connection with the motions filed

in the Florida Action;

• Reviewed and responded to the SEC’s motion to expand the

receiver;
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• Prepared for and participated in courts hearings in the Florida

Action;

• Coordinated with Florida counsel in the Florida Action;

• Reviewed transcripts of testimony taken by the SEC over the past

several years;

• Corresponded with the SEC regarding transcripts;

• Retained an expert accountant

• Investigated and interviewed potential local counsel in connection

with the Vermont Action, some of whom had conflicts.

A review of the invoices demonstrates that fees incurred, $204,852, were necessary and

reasonable in light of the complex and multi-jurisdictional nature of the lawsuits against Quiros.

III. AN ADDITIONAL $50,000 SHOULD BE RELEASED AS A RETAINER TO PAY
QUIROS’ ACCOUNTING EXPERT; AND A REASONABLE ADDITIONAL
AMOUNT SHOULD BE RELEASED TO PERMIT QUIROS TO RETAIN
VERMONT COUNSEL

In connection with proceedings in the Florida Action, Quiros had to retain an expert

accountant. Gordon Decl. ¶ 7. To pay his retainer, an additional $50,000 should be released

immediately. Quite simply, Quiros cannot defend the charges against him without expert

assistance. Id. ¶ 7.

In addition, Plaintiff’s original Florida counsel has withdrawn from the case, and Plaintiff

needs $25,000 to be released to retain substitute Florida counsel, Gray Robinson. Id. ¶ 8. In

light of the complexities of the Florida Action, this retainer is modest.

Finally, Quiros needs funds to retain Vermont counsel. Id. ¶ 9. It is therefore appropriate

that an additional amount sufficient to retain Vermont counsel be released.
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IV. CONCLUSION

For the foregoing reasons, Defendant Quiros requests that this Motion be granted and that

the Court order that funds be released as follows: (i) $204,852 to pay MSK’s legal fees through

April 30, 2016; (ii) $50,000 to pay the retainer of Quiros’ accounting expert; (iii) $25,000 to

retain substitute Florida counsel, Gray Robinson; (iv) a sum in an amount sufficient to permit

Quiros to retain Vermont counsel.

WHEREFORE, Defendants respectfully request that this Honorable Court enter an Order

awarding Defendants the requested fees and costs.

CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO LOCAL RULE 7.1(A)(3)

Undersigned counsel has conferred with counsel for Plaintiff to determine whether there

is any objection to the relief sought herein and, and is advised that Plaintiff objects, as follows

“SEC’s objects to any frozen funds being used to pay the fees and Quiros has failed to identify

what assets he would use to pay such fees. Also, the SEC notes that he has insufficient frozen

liquid assets to pay the fees.”

GRAYROBINSON, P.A.
333 S.E. Second Avenue, Suite 3200
Miami, FL 33131
Phone: 305.416.6880
Fax: 305.416.6887
Attorneys for Defendant

By: /s/ Karen L. Stetson
Karen L. Stetson
Florida Bar. No. 742937
karen.stetson@gray-robinson.com
Jonathan L. Gaines
Florida Bar. No. 330361
jonathan.gaines@gray-robinson.com

and
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David B. Gordon
Jaclyn H. Grodin
(Pro Hac Vice)
12 East 49th Street, 30th Floor
New York, NY 10017
Telephone: (212) 509-3900
Facsimile: (212) 509-7239
dbg@msk.com
jhg@msk.com

Mark T. Hiraide
(Pro Hac Vice)
11377 West Olympic Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 90064-1683
Telephone: (310) 312-2000
Facsimile: (310) 312-3100
mth@msk.com

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing has been filed with

the Clerk of the Court and furnished via CM/ECF to all participating recipients, on this 6th day

of May, 2016.

By: /s/Karen L. Stetson
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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA

CASE NO. 1:16-cv-21301-DPG

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff,

v.

ARIEL QUIROS,
WILLIAM STENGER,
JAY PEAK, INC.,
Q RESORTS, INC.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES PHASE II L.P.,
JAY PEAK MANAGEMENT, INC.,
JAY PEAK PENTHOUSE SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES, INC.,
JAY PEAK GOLF AND MOUNTAIN SUITES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES GOLF, INC.,
JAY PEAK LODGE AND TOWNHOUSES L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES LODGE, INC.,
JAY PEAK HOTEL SUITES STATESIDE L.P.,
JAY PEAK GP SERVICES STATESIDE, INC.,
JAY PEAK BIOMEDICAL RESEARCH PARK L.P.,
AnC BIO VERMONT GP SERVICES, LLC,

Defendants, and

JAY CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT, INC.,
GSI OF DADE COUNTY, INC.,
NORTH EAST CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.,
Q BURKE MOUNTAIN RESORT, LLC,

Relief Defendants.
______________________________________/

DECLARATION OF DAVID GORDON IN SUPPORT OF ARIEL QUIROS’ MOTION
FOR ORDER PERMITTING PAYMENT OF ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS

I, DAVID B. GORDON, hereby declare as follows:
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1. I am an attorney at law and a member, through my professional corporation of the

firm of Mitchell Silberberg & Knupp LLP (“MSK”), attorneys for Defendant Ariel Quiros. I

make this Declaration in support of Defendants Quiros’ Motion For An Order Permitting

Payment Of Attorney’s Fees And Costs in this matter.

2. I am lead counsel on this matter. Since the SEC’s ex parte filing on April 13,

2016 of an eighty-one-page Complaint, a sixty-page Motion for a Temporary Restraining Order

and Preliminary Injunction, and a Motion to Appoint a Receiver (the “Florida Action”), three

partners and a senior associate from MSK have spent significant time working on behalf of

Quiros to defend against the SEC’s claims. Two additional associates have provided assistance

with significant legal research needed to oppose the SEC’s submissions, and Quiros also engaged

the law firm of Berger Singerman LLP as local counsel, as well as for substantive assistance in

the analysis of the SEC’s allegations against him.

3. While the SEC had months, and perhaps years, to prepare its papers, Quiros’

attorneys have had to begin almost from scratch and have undertaken significant amounts of

legal research, fact gathering, analysis, witness interviews, document review and expert

preparation on Quiros’ behalf in the three weeks since the SEC’s sudden commencement of this

action. This work further consists of the close review of the documents submitted by the SEC in

support of its motions, which include thousands of pages of prior SEC testimony, dozens of

witness and party declarations, and hundreds of individual documents.

4. Collectively, Quiros’ attorneys in the Florida Action have filed the following

papers, requiring hundreds of hours of attorney time: an Emergency Motion to Lift or Modify the

Asset Freeze Order; a Declaration from Quiros in support of the same; a Supplemental

Declaration from Quiros as ordered by the Court in support of Quiros’ Application for the
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Release of Funds for Living Expenses; the Opposition to the SEC’s Motion for the Appointment

of a Receiver and a Preliminary Injunction; and Declarations in Support of Quiros’ Opposition.

The attorney time necessary to draft and file these documents in such a short period of time has

been substantial and all consuming, given the expedited nature of the proceeding and sheer

breadth of the allegations, spanning eight years and eight limited partnerships.

5. In addition, the State of Vermont has also filed the Vermont Action against

Quiros and the additional defendants in this action. A true and correct copy of the complaint in

the Vermont action is attached hereto as Exhibit 1. The fifty-page complaint contains fifteen

counts and alleges violations of Vermont’s state securities laws and Consumer Protection Act.

MSK attorneys have been actively coordinating Quiros’ defense of the Vermont Action and have

spent substantial time seeking to obtain local counsel to assist in Quiros’ defense, as Vermont

requires, a task made particularly time consuming and difficult given the scope of the allegations

in the Vermont Action and number of firms that have had disqualifying conflicts to a

representation of Quiros. MSK attorneys have closely analyzed the allegations of the Vermont

Action; researched Vermont law in connection with the preparation of a response to the

complaint; and reviewed the file in the Florida Action in order to analyze and defend against the

claims asserted, including spending hours reviewing the multiple volumes of SEC transcripts of

Quiros and co-defendant William Stenger. A response to the Complaint in the Vermont Action

is currently due on June 10, 2016.

6. In connection with MSK’s work on the instant case and the Vermont Action,

Quiros has incurred attorney’s fees through April 30, 2016 in the amount of $204,852. A true

and correct copy of MSK’s invoice for that time (redacted to protect the attorney-client and

work-product privilege) is attached hereto as Exhibit 2. I have reviewed Exhibit 2. In this case,
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MSK reviewed and analyzed two complaints raising complex factual and legal issues; conferred

with Quiros and others as part of fact investigation; reviewed the SEC’s papers filed in support

of the motion for a preliminary injunction; drafted and revised pleadings in connection with the

motion to lift the asset freeze and the SEC’s motion for a preliminary injunction in the Florida

Action; researched numerous issues relating to federal and Vermont securities laws, the

standards for freezing assets, and the issues raised in the preliminary injunction; communicated

with the receiver; drafted declarations in connection with the motions filed in the Florida Action;

organized numerous exhibits in connection with the motions filed in the Florida Action;

reviewed and responded to the SEC’s motion to expand the receiver; prepared for and

participated in courts hearings in the Florida Action; coordinated with Florida counsel in the

Florida Action; reviewed transcripts of testimony taken by the SEC over the past several years;

corresponded with the SEC regarding transcripts; retained an expert accountant; investigated and

interviewed potential local counsel in connection with the Vermont Action, some of whom had

conflicts.

7. In connection with proceedings in the Florida Action, Quiros had to retain an

expert accountant. To pay his retainer, an additional $50,000 should be released immediately.

Quite simply, Quiros cannot defend the charges against him without expert assistance. If the

Court deems it necessary, Quiros will provide a copy of the agreement with the accounting

expert in camera.

8. The law firm of Berger Singerman LLP has recently substituted out of the case,

replaced by Gray Robinson. To retain Gray Robinson, Mr. Quiros needs funds sufficient to pay

a retainer of $25,000.
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9. To defend himself adequately in the Vermont Action, Quiros will need funds to

retain counsel.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of America that the

foregoing is true and correct.

Executed this 6th day of May, 2016, at New York, NY.

_/s/ David Gordon____

David Gordon

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-1   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 5 of 5



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 1 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 2 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 3 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 4 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 5 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 6 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 7 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 8 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 9 of 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 10 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 11 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 12 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 13 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 14 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 15 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 16 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 17 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 18 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 19 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 20 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 21 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 22 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 23 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 24 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 25 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 26 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 27 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 28 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 29 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 30 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 31 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 32 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 33 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 34 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 35 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 36 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 37 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 38 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 39 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 40 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 41 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 42 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 43 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 44 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 45 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 46 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 47 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 48 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 49 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 50 of
 51



Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-2   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 51 of
 51



04/14/16 Draft declaration for A. 
Quiros; legal research 
regarding 

; draft 
brief insert regarding same; 
conference with counsel for 
receive; analysis of issues 
with DEC 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

FID # :95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	3 

PROFORMA ID: 	1486281 

Fees through April 30, 2016 

Dispute with the SEC and State of 
Vermont 
47553-00001 

04/13/16 Begin review of court 
documents and planning 
strategy for response to SEC 
lawsuit, and multiple calls 
with client, receiver's 
counsel, co-counsel and SEC 
re: seizure of assets and 
receivership 

04/14/16 Work on court papers re: 
asset freeze; work on 
strategy; numerous calls and 
emails with client and 
co-counsel re: prep of court 
papers and arguments 

04/15/16 Research cases to support 

i
sition that 

D . GORDON 6.00 4,170.00 

D . GORDON 3.70 2,571.50 

J . GRODIN 8.80 4,752.00 

C . MURRAY 2.00 800.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 1 of 18



o issues 
r ing same with MTH and 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # :95-1853538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/15/16 Call with Berger Singerman 
re: motion to unfreeze 
assets; work on supporting 
brief; multiple emails with 
the MSK team re: prep of 
court papers; calls with 
client re: same; call and 
emails with Citibank's 
counsel re: loan to Quiros 

04/15/16 Draft memorandum in support 
of modification of asset 
freeze; conference with FL 
counsel, DEG and MTH; legal 
research regarding 

DEG 

04/15/16 Rev -wed offering memos for 
gialgaVIT44% information 
and created new pdf's for 
JHG, Zipped files 

04/16/16 Work on brief in support of 
motion to unfreeze assets; 
calls with client re: 
Strategy 	 ■ • 

04/16/16 Legal research regarding 
mita-fa-a:a; 

review and revise brief in 
support of motion for 
modification; conference 
with MTH regarding 
background and freeze 

(41.SSues; review SEC 
memorandum of law in support 
of PI/TRO and asset freeze 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	4 

D . GORDON 3.30 2,293.50 

J . GRODIN 7.50 4,050.00 

N . TRAN 1.00 170.00 

D 	. GORDON 3.50 2,432.50 

J . GRODIN 7.80 4,212.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 2 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # :95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/26/16 Telephone conferences with 
J.Grodin re SEC TRO and 
Receivership action; review 
SEC Complaint, Motion for 
TRO; Supporting 
Declarations; review and 
revise draft motion to amend 
asset freeze order. 

04/17/16 Work on brief; multiple 
calls and email with M. 
Hiraide, J. Grodin, A. 
Quiros, B. Kelly, and J. 
Diamond re: responding to 
lawsuits; email to 
Receiverts counsel 

04/17/16 Review and revise draft 
brief in support of 
modification of freeze 
order; conference with MTH 
egardng 	emails with 

MTH and DBG regarding same 

04/17/16 Review documents and 
pleadings re SEC Complaint 
and Motion for TRO and PI. 
Review and revise draft 
motion to modify asset 
freeze. Telephone 
conferences with D.Gordon 
and J.Grodin re same. 

04/18/16 Work on brief; multiple 
emails with J. Grodin, M. 
Hiraide and C. Lichtman re: 
same; call with same re: 
revisions; call with 
Receiver re: Q Burke; texts 
and iiigs with A. Quiros 
re: 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	5 

M 	. HIRAIDE 3.40 2,040.00 

D 	. GORDON 4.00 2,780.00 

J 	. GRODIN 2.50 1,350.00 

M 	. HIRAIDE 5.20 3,120.00 

D 	. GORDON 2.70 1,876.50 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 3 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID #: 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/18/16 Review and revise draft 
brief; conference with MTH 
regarding same; emails to FL 
local counsel regarding 
status of brief; conference 
with DBG regarding same; 
conference call with FL 
counsel, DBG and MTH 
regarding brief and filing 

04/18/16 Telephone conference with 
D.Gordon, J.Grodin, 
C.Lichtman re motion for 
relief from asset freeze; 
review and revise draft 
motion. 

04/19/16 Work on brief; call with 
SEC; multiple emails with C. 
Lichtman, J. Grodin and M. 
Hiraide re: motion to modify 
freeze; calls with A. Quiros 
re: 	 ns77  

email to counsel 
to Receiver re: privilege 
issues 

04/19/16 Review and revise draft 
brief; organize exhibits in 
support of draft brief; 
conference with FL local 
counsel regarding filing of 
same; e-mails to FL local 
and DBG regarding i=1;17.1 

11101111.016  

04/19/16 Review revised draft motion 
for modification of asset 
freeze; review emails re 
sale. 

04/19/16 New Jay Peak matter: Created 
pdf's of exhibits to the 
Freeze Modification 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	6 

J 	. GRODIN 6.80 3,672.00 

M 	. HIRAIDE 4.20 2,520.00 

D . GORDON 2.50 1,737.50 

J . GRODIN 5.10 2,754.00 

M 	. HIRAIDE 1.60 960.00 

N 	. TRAN .50 85.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 4 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # :95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/20/16 Emails with J. Grodin and C. 
Lichtman re: court filing of 
Receiver; calls and emails 
with client re: 41111111111 

cal with Stenger's counsel 
re: 

04/20/16 Review motion to extend; 
e-mail to FL local with 
edits to same; review and 
sign motion for PHV; review 
local rules in connection 
with same; review 
memorandums of law filed by 
SEC to expand receivership; 
e-mail summary to DBG and 
MTH regarding same; analysis 
of current issues with DBG 

04/20/16 Jay Peak no billing: 
Downloaded files for 
Emergency Motion to Modify 
Freeze order, zipped files 
and sent through yousendit 

04/21/16 Quires—research and analyze 

04/21/16 Numerous calls and emails 
with Receiver, SEC, client 
and C. Lichtman re: freeze 
order; Receiver's motion to 
extend receivership, court 
hearings, and allowable 
expenses of client; prep for 
court hearings on 4/22 and 
4/25; emails with Stenger's 
counsel re: Stenger's 
various positions; review 
multiple court filings 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	7 

D . GORDON 1.60 1,112.00 

J . GRODIN 4.70 2,538.00 

N . TRAN .30 51.00 

J . NOGUES 2.50 1,937.50 

D . GORDON 4.40 3,058.00 

and'Eafifiiet! 
, emails re same; 

Review and analyze complaints 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 5 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # ; 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/21/16 Conference with R. Martinez 
regarding W. Stenger; e-mail 
to DEG regarding same; 
review memos filed by 
Receiver and SEC; conference 
with MTH regarding status 

04/21/16 Review supplement motion 
filed by Receiver; telephone 
conference with J.Grodin re 
same. 

04/22/16 Quiros--Meeting with D. 
Gordon, R. Rotstein and M. 
Hiraide; Review and analyze 

draft 
letter to insurer re interim 
agreement on defense costs; 
Review materials from SEC 
case; analyze 111.1.1111 
1111111 

04/22/16 Meet with David Gordon, Mark 
Hirade, Jean Nogues 
regarding case (.7); search 
Internet for case background 
(.7) 

04/22/16 Prep for and participate in 
call with court, including 
emails and calls with local 
counsel and Receiver; begin 
prep of responses to SEC 
Complaint, VT Complaint and 
preliminary injunction 
application; call with 
counsel for NECS 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	8 

J 	. GRODIN 2.70 1,458.00 

M HIRAIDE 1.80 1,080.00 

J . NOGUES 4.50 3,487.50 

R . ROTSTEIN 1.40 1,127.00 

D . GORDON 3.80 2,641.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 6 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

FID # : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 
Page: 

04/22/16 Compile chart of allegations 
in complaint that Wel= 

J . GRODIN 5.30 

E) 1111.1mrk 
ana ys1:: _r Egiillg9S:c4577771.4 
OPPirmr—ee'zmodifIcati 

conrerence with 
MTH, DBG and JPN regarding 
response to preliminary 
injunction application; 
email to MTH and JPN 
regarding 	• 

04/22/16 Attend telephonic hearing on M . HIRAIDE 4.70 
Receiver's emergency 
motions; conference with 
D.Gordon, 	J.Nogues, 
R.Rotstein; review and 
respond to various emails re 
opposition to preliminary 
injunction motion. 

04/22/16 Quiros - downloaded doc #46 
exhibits 

N . TRAN 1.00 

04/23/16 Quiros--Review injunction 
and freeze motion and 
exhibits; Review and revise 
letter to Ironshore re 
interim funding 

J . NOGUES 4.20 

04/23/16 Analyze Vermont complaint R 	. ROTSTEIN 2.90 
(2.9) 

04/23/16 Call with client re: D 	. GORDON 2.50 

emaiis with J. Nogues and J. 
Grodin re: same 

lIngtc and multiple 

2016 
9 

2,862.00 

2,820.00 

170.00 

3,255.00 

2,334.50 

1,737.50 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 7 of 18



FID # :95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	10 

1.10 594.00 

2.10 1,627.50 

4.90 3,944.50 

3.40 2,363.00 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/23/16 Review emails from DBG 	J GRODIN 
regarding response to 
preliminak,y injunction; 
review abOgntr-d-dUcealo 
WF77i-eqarog7Bi-dtE2d - 

- 

04/24/16 Review preliminary 	 J . NOGUES 
injunction papers 

04/24/16 Further analysis of Vermont 	R . ROTSTEIN 
complaint and brief research 
re Vermont law (3.2); begin 
reading SEC transcript, A. 
Quiros (1.7) 

04/24/16 Calls with client re: 

t7T7 	71.s.ca(7. 
0—m:eaQn 

with yILH 	 Tin 
re: t$7.',tateo: 	ffttti.; 
emaili 
g..gig°5€777aq 	 e;J 

ajum,mai 
with B. Kelly's lawyer; prep 
for oral argument 

04/25/16 Telephone call with D. 
Gordon re VIMMUMMOW 

7Lr-ra7tIETT7tAIMIMIRNMOINCa'-̀-  
„:E0  te'Fnnji , 

prepare pro hac vice 
application; Review and 
analyze materials, re 
preliminary injunction 
motion; emails re same with 
D. Gordon and J. Grodin 

D . GORDON 

J . NOGUES 	 2.20 1,705.00 

04/25/16 Further review of complaint, 	R . ROTSTEIN 	4.80 3,864.00 
transcript (3.9); research 
and calls regarding Vermont 
counsel (Joshua Diamond) (.9) 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 8 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

FID #: 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	11 

04/25/16 Analysis o 
for 

SEC Complaint 
-ttIMMMIW 

D . GORDON 17.50 12,162.50 

ift 
of 	 mehtI-97Ta? 
rZt7117-s 
-1717 Taa__Lr 
review and analysis of court 
filings by SEC and Receiver; 
review 11th Circuit cases 
and lri&F7771t7t717,31127ErA 4:; 

; -.tend orai—argu; 
call with client re: teiTt7 
Immilt ;  work on: prep of 
declaration requested by 
Judge Gayles; work on app to 
order to show cause; email 
to SEC re: deadlines 

04/25/16 Review  IIIIIV'5' —'Ar;fal)  
';_711111 per DEG; e-mail 
analysis to JPN regarding 
same; emails to FL local 
counsel regarding pro hac 
vice motions; legal research 
regarding pmggicia774741) 

113 	 

L'5S 	 email 
analysis to MTH regarding 
same 

04/25/16 Quiros - Saved all remaining N . TRAN 
pleadings from docket and 
various emails into Docket 
folder on PSF 

04/26/16 Call with G. Gulisano; 
Review Kelly and Quiros SEC 
testimony. 

1.50 	255.00 

J . GRODIN 
	

7.10 3,834.00 

J . NOGUES 
	

2.80 2,170.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 9 of 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

FID # : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	12 

04/26/16 Read, study SEC transcript 	R . ROTSTEIN 	6.90 5,554.50 
(A. Quiros testimony) (5.4); 
contact, research various 
Vermont lawyers regarding 
representation (1.5) 

04/26/16 Email to SEC; work on 
preliminary injunction 
opposition papers, including 

dRAIVirdi 	emails with 
B. Stenger re: 

emails with B. 
Keill 	•nsel re: 
MWEEMTM 	,-mails with B. 

D . GORDON 	 3.80 2,641.00 

Ro - 

   

emails wit:: client J_Li 
co- : 	[or Citi r-: 

  

  

04/26/16 Conferenc 	,1 ! MTH to 	 J . GRODIN 	 4.20 2,268.00 
analyze eMlao,717L.E'x,,e -n5-e- -;4:, ; 
legal researcn Leyaidlily 
same; respond to emails from 
DBG regarding case status 
and subpoenas 

04/26/16 Telephone conference with 	M . HIRAIDE 
J.Grodin re Quiros financial 
declaration; telephone 
conference with A.Quiros re 
same; telephone conference 
with J.Nogues re 

1.60 	960.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 10 of
 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

FID # : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	13 

04/27/16 Legal research regarding re 	. NOGUES 	 5.80 4,495.00 

emails re same;-Review Bill 
Kelly testimony; emails re 
same; Review and analyze 
preliminary injunction 
motion and complaint re 
opposing motion 

04/27/16 Continue lining up Vermont 	R . ROTSTEIN 	6.20 4,991.00 
counsel (2.5); further 
background, reading SEC 
transcripts, documents (3.7) 

04/27/16 Work on proposed order; 
emails with SEC re: 
deadlines and motions; 
emails with Receiver re: 
same; emails with Citi's 
counsel re: potential 
intervention; work on 
retention of VT firm and 
calls with same; emails with 
B. Martinez re: Stenger; 
emails with J. Grodin re: MI  
apppit emails with Kelly's 
counsel re: metlimur 
gspOmplamte;  work on 
opposition arguments to 
preliminary injunction; 
emails with client re: NW 
q:1;i14ANNAMISEEr; email to 
Receiver re: same; work on 
tg 	 ; work 
on motion for extension; 
work on Quiros Declaration; 
develop motion to dismiss 
arguments 

D . GORDON 	 4.60 3,197.00 

04/27/16 Analysis of .t.?tpeniiMpf 7.t1. 	J . GRODIN 	 9.70 5,238.00 

11VAIMONDR*; draft 
eciaration in support of 
same; e-mails to DBG and MTH 
regarding declaration 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 11 of
 18



h J. Grodin, 
0. Ravid, and M. Hiraide; 
research the same. 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID #: 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/27/16 Telephone conference with 
J.Grodin and A.Quiros re 
(-140101W-a4r i  review 
emails by D.Gordon, 
J.Nouges; review and revise 
draft Quiros Declaration re 
personal expenses. 

04/28/16 Review injunction and 
receivership papers; calls 
and emails re,w _ 

L. Ili- 4 ;  Review latest 
order; Legal research 
regarding motion; Review 
prior briefs on various 
issues 

04/28/16 Further research of Vermont 
law, read background 
materials (4.7); telephone 
conference with Ed:taTM  

--s=14,474-triEU 
__i_,6]-otifzlr U 	(.7); 

04/28/16 Discuss research re: impOON 

04/28/16 Work on Quiros declaration; 
review numerous court 
filings; work on proposed 
Order; emails with SEC and 
receiver re: same; emails 
with Citi counsel re: 
subpoena; begin drafting 
,WW30:411MIL; emails with 
Kelly's counsel; work on 

VAllellgt; call 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	14 

M . HIRAIDE 4.40 2,640.00 

J . NOGUES 7.50 5,812.50 

R . ROTSTEIN 5.40 4,347.00 

R DESAI 2.20 880.00 

D 	. GORDON 5.20 3,614.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 12 of
 18



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

with VII/NIMMI#Ongr.-7. 
:#,POMP&Itre'lt7cT4a 

emails with SEC 
re: Gulisano transcript; 
emails with Stenger's 
counsel; review court 
notices; review motion for 
sealing; review motion for 
extension 

04/28/16 Finalize and file 
	

J . GRODIN 
declaration in support of 
motion to release funds; 
analysis of issues with MTH; 
calls with A. Quiros 
impmgegmmgomp ;  conference 
with FL local regarding 
t.-4EITn7TuiflOOMMI; email to 
SEC regarding transcript; 
call with R. Martinez 
regarding Stenger 

04/28/16 Review and respond to 	 M . HIRAIDE 
various correspondence re 
opposition to preliminary 
injunction; telephone 
conference with R.Desai; 
O.Ravid; J.Grodin re legal 
research assignments in 
connection with opposition 
to preliminary injunction; 
prepare email to SEC 
(Levenson) re testimony 
transcript. 

04/28/16 Calls with J. Grodin and M. 	0 . RAVID 
Hiralde regarding case and 
research needed for 
opposition motions. 

FID if: 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	15 

	

10.20 	5,508.00 

	

1.70 	1,020.00 

.50 	170.00 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 13 of
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04/29/16 Work on motion to dismiss, 
including arguments re:1111W  

7-,.`77711'71-d77- 75A4; work on 

II ghC753T7e.  
r work on 

77,..fq.,q,fr-; review 
tiL 	andiftialls with 

„counsel for Citi 
re : same, emails with 
Receiver's counsel re: 
privileged documents; emails 
with Receiver re: client's 
property; email with J. 
Nogues re: 11111LW; emails 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID #: 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/29/16 Review and analyze materials 
re preliminary injunction 
motion; draft T7NIFY 
ik-Aft..*Nsire* -$7777 multiple calls 
and emails re factual 
development, legal issues 
and legal research 

04/29/16 Further read background 
material, communicate with 
Vermont counsel (3.9) 

04/29/16 Legal research regarding 
ittgirqrTENWT4Or.; legal 

regarding 

draft email 
memorandum regarding 
research findings; call with 
D. Gordon regarding same. 

04/29/16 Research Mr-W,L7f:k17--  

3t7g7t.  

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	16 

J . NOGUES 7.30 5,657.50 

R . ROTSTEIN 3.90 3,139.50 

B . MULLINS 4.90 2,646.00 

R . DESAI 2.50 1,000.00 

D . GORDON 6.30 4,378.50 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 14 of
 18



with 

Mullins re: 
4Nat52Et--5T  

call with '7[. 
MINIMPRIMM 

04/29/16 Legal research regarding 

conference 
with 	L'17 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

with Stenger's counsel re: 
documents; work [ on, argument 
re : 

	711i•-•  
•Jl4 ' ; 	IttJL; 

emai_ 	.1' counsel re: 
; emails 

with hrAnscripts; 
work or- 
work onii'.45.0-rerti-al? 

FID # : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	17 

J . GRODIN 	 9.20 4,968.00 

ViIiT [[[.[ 
a 	 

conference 
with A. Quiros 
000,1re-mail to DBG and MTH 
regarding research; 
conference with MTH, RXD and 
OXR regarding research tasks 

Case 1:16-cv-21301-DPG   Document 109-3   Entered on FLSD Docket 05/06/2016   Page 15 of
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IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL,  SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # : 95-1683538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/29/16 Respond to SEC (Levenson) 
email re testimony 
transcript; review and 
respond to various 
correspondence re opposition 

M HIRAIDE 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	18 

2.40 	1,440.00 

to motion for preliminary 
injunction; telephone 
conference with R.Ruchi, 
O.Ravid, 	J.Grodin re legal 
research; telephone 
conference with J.Grodin re 
Quiros Declaration. 

04/29/16 Call with M. Hiralde, 	J. 0 . RAVID 3.30 1,122.00 
Grodin, R. Desai to discuss 
the case and research issues 
[.4; read materials and 
research issues pertaining 
t 	e.).1 

zZa.Tt,x4z -- 
[2.9 

04/30/16 Dr: 	 :,21(1 revise J . NOGUES 3.80 2,945.00 
-E1-717:EI,17 .1 ?_Tid:7 	Review 
ana analyze materials re 
same; Telephone conference 
with D. Gordon, R. Rotstein 
and M. Hiraide re status, 
legal issues and preparation 
of response to OSC 

04/30/16 Telephone conference with R . ROTSTEIN 2.60 2,093.00 
100!$Eltiigfiiillir(.4); read, _ 
analyze Nogues chart, emails 
relevant to mar (1.2); 
participate in telephone 
call with attorney team 
(1.00) 
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04/30/16 Research W,,U0df,§-ficer 	 R . DESAI 

"V'T ettligfti 	 61:3 

draft memo 
regardi3The same. 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/30/16 Legal research regarding 
	

B . MULLINS 
whether 

47Bit.:=771" 

grs'YStetu.8); email with 
D. Gordoh regarding research 
findings and additional 
research task (0.2). 

04/30/16 Work on opposition to 	 D . GORDON 
preliminary injunction 
application, including 
review cases re: 

a1 gat cird 
call with J. Nogues, B. 
Rotstein and M. Hiraide re: 
factual and legal arguments 

04/30/16 Legal research regarding 	J . GRODIN 

e  _ 
review 

emails regarding issues 
researched by 0. Ravid; 
conference with MTH; email 
summary to MTH 

FID : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 	2016 
Page: 	19 

1.00 540.00 

1.40 560,00 

3.70 2,571.50 

3.30 1,782.00 

,V7-77A-77' 
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IN ACCOUNT WITH 

LAW OFFICES 

MITCHELL, SILBERBERG & KNUPP LLP 
A PARTNERSHIP INCLUDING PROFESSIONAL CORPORATIONS 

11377 WEST OLYMPIC BOULEVARD 

LOS ANGELES, CA 90064 

FID # : 95-1883538 

TELEPHONE (310) 312-2000 

FAX (310) 312-3100 

Ariel Quiros 
19 Grand Bay Estates Circle 
Key Biscayne, FL 33149 

04/30/16 Review legal research re 
opposition for motion for 
preliminary injunction; 
telephone conference with 
D.Gordon, J.Nogues, 
R.Rotstein; telephone 
conference with O.Ravin re 
legal research; telephone 
conference with J.Grodin re 
same. 

M . HIRAIDE 

00626 47553 
INVOICE: 	****** 

May 4, 2016 
Page: 	20 

4.80 	2,880.00 

04/30/16 Research _±lirs ialitT 	0 . RAVID 
	

3.70 1,258.00 
witn respect to 

SEC claims. 

Total fees: $204,852.00 

(Titles print on draft only) 
PARTNER 39.00 hours at $805.00 
PARTNER 42.70 hours at $775.00 
PARTNER 82.50 hours at $695.00 
N/E PARTNER 35.80 hours at $600.00 
ASSOCIATE 5.90 hours at $540.00 
ASSOCIATE 96.00 hours at $540.00 
ASSOCIATE 2.00 hours at $400.00 
ASSOCIATE 6.10 hours at $400.00 
ASSOCIATE 7.50 hours at $340.00 
LEGAL ASST 4.30 hours at $170.00 

321.80 

*** SUMMARY *** 
R. ROTSTEIN 
J. NOGUES 
D. GORDON 
M. HIRAIDE 

MULLINS 
J. GRODIN 
C. MURRAY 
R. DESAI 
0. RAVID 
N. TRAN 

SUMMARY TOTALS 

31,395.00 
= 	33,092.50 

57,337.50 
= 21,480.00 

3,186.00 
51,840.00 

800.00 
2,440.00 
2,550.00 

731.00 

$204,852.00 

Costs Advanced and In-house Services through April 30, 2016 

Total costs: $0. 00 

  

Total Fees & Costs: 	 $204,852.00 
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